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26 ea. *
Saw, cut-off machine handheld, engine power 3.2kw, engine speed 9,000 rpm, UNIT
Max Spindle speed 5,350 rpm, Arbor size 20 mm, Max Wheel size 14" (350mm) PRICE 954.00 No Bid 889.00 No Bid No Bid
Maxx Cutting Depth 4.9" (125mm) Mfg: Stihl, Model TS420 or approved equal TOTAL 24,804.00 23,114.00
1. Manufacturer MFR. Stihl Stihl TS420
4 ea.
Saw, walk behind concrete arbor size 1", blade capacity 20", blade RPM 2600, *
blade shaft diameter 1-1/4", fuel type gasolen, fue capacity 2, configuration UNIT
medium walk behind saw, drive speed 0-80, max depth of cut 7.625, low oil alert PRICE 3,853.00 4,040.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
motor HP 11 GX390 gas engine, self propoelled, belted blade shaft drive TOTAL 15,412.00 16,160.00
2. Manufacturer MFR. Diamond Products | Diamond 5800643
15 ea.
Pump, trash package 3" suction port, 3" discharge port discharge capacity 319 *
gal/min Honda GX240 engine, air-cooled 4-stroke, OHV single cylinder, w/3" x UNIT
20" knaflex suction hose QD fittings, 3" x 50" grey discharge hose QD fitting, 3" PRICE 1,490.00 No Bid 1,498.00 1,810.00 No Bid
male QD x 3" male NPT with wheel kit, Honda P/N WT30X or approved equal TOTAL 22,350.00 22,470.00 27,150.00
3. Manufacturer MFR. Honda Honda WT30XK3A
11 ea.
Pavement breaker, pneumatic, length 2y-1/2", bore & stroke 2-7/16" x 5-9/32", UNIT *
impact rate 1380 blows/min, air consumption 62 CFM, 3/4" NPT air inlet Dia., PRICE 1,050.00 1,136.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
4. chuck size: 1-1/8"H x 6"; 1-1/4"H x 6', Mfg. Sullair, Model: MPB90A or approved equal TOTAL 11,550.00 12,496.00
1 ea.
Generator, approximate size: 41"L x 28 3/4"W x 28 1/4"H, engine type: 4-stroke, overhead *
valve, single cylinder, 3600 RPM, forced air cooling system, 6 gal fuel tank, AC output: UNIT
Voltage 120V/240V, Frequency 60 H Z, 30.0A/15.0A current, output 3.6 KVA, Max PRICE 1,995.00 No Bid 1,667.00 No Bid No Bid
5. output 4.0 KVA, Mfg: Honda, Model EM4000SX or approved equal TOTAL 1,995.00 1,667.00
50 ea. *
Locator, Metal; batteries powered, LCD display w/numeric digital, analog bar-graph, UNIT
powerline indicator & low battery indicator, 42-1/2" Long, high impact water resistant PRICE 611.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid
6. plastic, aluminum sensor tube, waterproof; Mfg. Magna Trak Model: MT200 or approved equal TOTAL No Bid 30,550.00
2 ea. *
Grade, light (Laser), size 14-3/4" long, 5-1/2" dia., armored die cast housing, NiMH battery, UNIT
6-16V DC operating voltage range, waterproof up to 10 ft, -15% to 40% grade range Mfg. Spectra |PRICE 4,196.00 No Bid No Bid 4,200.00
7. Precision Laser, Model: DG711 or approved equal TOTAL No Bid 8,392.00 8,400.00
4 ea. *
Plate, vibratory, centrifugal force 3550 Ibs., exciter 4400 (VPM), travel speed: 110 ft/min, UNIT
compaction depth: 18", plate size: 21" x 22", engine; Mfg. MBW, Model No. 3550 or approved PRICE 2,192.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
8. equal TOTAL 8,768.00
TOTAL VENDOR AWARD TOTAL 58,080.00 38,942.00 24,781.00
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Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days
Delivery Days
*LOW BIDDER
BID INVITATIONS MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:
ASCO MSC Industrial Supply Demandstar
AIW Mustang Equipment SAWS Website

Baytech Supply

Fastenal Ind. & Const. Supplies
Grainger

Industrial Supply Solutions
Mapa Distributors

Nations Rent

Royall Matthiessen
Sunbelt Mill Supply
Thompson Pump Mfg.
United Tool & Fasteners




